
BIDDER 
(A,B,C,E

TC.)
BIDDER Company Name  BASE BID ($) 

 ALTERNATE 3
(Elevator 

Modernization) 

 ALTERNATE 4a
(Card Readers
Levels 1 & 2) 

 ALTERNATE 4b
(Card Readers
Levels 3 & 4) 

 ALTERNATE 5
(Fire Sprinklers) 

 Unit Price # 1
(Wall Touch-Up 

/ 100 sq.ft.) 

 Unit Price # 2
(Ceiling Touch-
Up / 100 sq.ft.) 

 TOTAL BID
(Base Bid + Selected 

Alternate) 

BID PACKAGE NO. 01 - HVAC
1 A.O. Reed & Co. No Bid No Bid
2 Alpha Mechanical $8,139,000.00 $8,139,000.00
3 Circulating Air, Inc. $7,936,000.00 $7,936,000.00
4 Critchfield Mechanical, Inc. No Bid No Bid
5 University Mechanical $11,073,660.00 $11,073,660.00
6 Xcel Mechanical Systems, Inc. $8,554,444.00 $8,554,444.00

$7,936,000.00 7,936,000.00$         

BID PACKAGE NO. 02 - PLUMBING
1 A.O. Reed & Co. No Bid No Bid
2 Alpha Mechanical $2,831,700.00 $2,831,700.00
3 University Mechanical $2,484,805.00 $2,484,805.00

2,484,805.00$         2,484,805.00$         

BID PACKAGE NO. 03 - FIRE PROTECTION
1 Apex Fire Protection See Alternate # 05 $986,200.00 $986,200.00
2 Kimble & Co. See Alternate # 05 $1,340,414.00 $1,340,414.00
3 XL Fire Protection See Alternate # 05 $945,000.00 $945,000.00

$0.00 945,000.00$             

BID PACKAGE NO. 04 - ELECTRICAL & LOW VOLTAGE 
1 A.J. Kirkwood & Asso. $3,462,322.00 $0.00 $86,209.00 $7,023.00 $642,458.00 $4,190,989.00
2 Baker Electric, Inc. $2,982,000.00 $10,000.00 $65,580.00 $39,000.00 $653,000.00 $3,710,580.00
3 Circle City Electric $3,300,000.00 $0.00 $72,000.00 $8,000.00 $524,000.00 $3,896,000.00
4 Morrow-Meadows Corp. $3,597,000.00 $20,200.00 $48,200.00 $29,855.00 $533,175.00 $4,198,575.00
5 Stronghold Engineering $4,602,000.00 $20,000.00 $72,000.00 $6,000.00 $527,000.00 $5,221,000.00

$2,982,000.00 3,710,580.00$         

BID PACKAGE NO. 05 - DEMOLITION & ABATEMENT
1 Ampco North No Bid No Bid
2 Bayview Services $2,768,716.00 $105,185.00 $2,873,901.00
3 Clauss Constuction No Bid No Bid
4 Force Demolition, Inc. No Bid No Bid
5 Integrated Demolition $1,760,000.00 $125,000.00 $1,885,000.00
6 Janus Corp. No Bid No Bid
7 Matrix Environmental, Inc. $3,086,109.16 $82,045.81 $3,168,154.97
8 MEC Inc. No Bid No Bid
9 National Demolition No Bid No Bid

10 Northstar Contracting Group No Bid No Bid

UCR Batchelor Hall Renewal (UCR Project # 950464)
Bid Date: 3/23/2021

parent Low Responsive Bidder: 

parent Low Responsive Bidder: 
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parent Low Responsive Bidder: 



11 Penhall Co. No Bid No Bid

$1,760,000.00 1,885,000.00$         

BID PACKAGE NO. 06 - CIP CONCRETE & REINFORCING STEEL

$502,916.00 -$                            

BID PACKAGE NO. 07 - STRUCTURAL STEEL & MISC. METALS
1 Bapko Metal No Bid
2 Crown Steel No Bid
3 Mulhauser Steel No Bid
4 Schroeder Iron No Bid
5 Southwest Steel of CA No Bid

$200,003.00 -$                            

BID PACKAGE NO. 10 - ROOFING & WATERPROOFING
1 BEST Contracting Services $898,450.00 $898,450.00
2 Letner Roofing No Bid No Bid
3 Roof Construction $1,080,895.00 $1,080,895.00
4 Stone Roofing Co. $667,640.00 Bid Withdrawn
5 WSP Roofing $859,000.00 Non Responsive

$667,640.00 898,450.00$             

BID PACKAGE NO. 11 - FLASHING & SHEET METAL
1 Letner Roofing No Bid No Bid
2 PGC Construction $292,500.00 $292,500.00
3 Rutherford Co. No Bid No Bid
4 San Diego Sheet Metal, Inc. $156,600.00 $156,500.00
5 VNSM No Bid No Bid
6 Weiss Sheet Metal $137,772.00 $137,772.00

$137,772.00 137,772.00$             

BID PACKAGE NO. 13 - DOORS, FRAMES, & HARDWARE
1 Design Hardware No Bid
2 Montgomery Hardware Co. $22,550.00 $34,800.00 $21,700.00 $57,350.00

$22,550.00 57,350.00$               

BID PACKAGE NO. 14 - METAL FRAMING & DRYWALL
1 Brady Co. Los Angeles $567,000.00 $129,000.00 $696,000.00
2 Caston, Inc. $435,585.00 $30,000.00 $465,585.00
3 Martin Bros. No Bid No Bid
4 Mirage Builders $847,777.00 $42,500.00 $890,277.00
5 Perez Construction Group No Bid No Bid
6 Preferred Ceilings, Inc. No Bid No Bid
7 Quality Production Services $368,800.00 $48,750.00 $417,550.00
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$368,800.00 417,550.00$             

BID PACKAGE NO. 16 - RESILIENT FLOORING
1 Lawrence W. Rosine Co. No Bid No Bid
2 Progressive Surface Solutions No Bid No Bid
3 Signature Flooring $14,800.00 $2,000.00 $16,800.00

$14,800.00 16,800.00$               

BID PACKAGE NO. 17 - PAINTING
1 The Blakely Co. $144,340.00 $26,148.00 $1.60 $2.06 $170,488.00
2 Pecoraro, Inc. $385,000.00 $55,000.00 $3.00 $4.00 $440,000.00
3 Randall McAnany Company No Bid $0.00 No Bid
4 Reyes Painting Contractor $202,000.00 $0.00 $360.00 $510.00 $202,000.00
5 Triumph Painting $158,800.00 $108,800.00 $2.25 $2.25 $267,600.00
6 Western Painting $187,000.00 $68,000.00 $1.50 $1.85 $255,000.00

$144,340.00 170,488.00$             

BID PACKAGE NO. 18 - SIGNAGE
1 A Good Sign & Graphics No Bid
2 Architectural Design & Signs No Bid
3 CA Signs No Bid
4 CR&A Custom Inc. No Bid
5 Premier Sign Service, Inc. No Bid
6 Sign Age Identity Systems No Bid
7 Superior Electrical Advertising No Bid

$25,000.00 -$                            

BID PACKAGE NO. 19 - LAB EQUIPMENT & CASEWORK
1 ISEC, Inc. $27,728.00 $27,728.00
2 Laboratory by Design, Inc. No Bid No Bid
3 Saxton Bradley, Inc. No Bid No Bid

$27,728.00 27,728.00$               

BID PACKAGE NO. 20 - ELEVATOR MODERNIZATION
1 KONE Elevator & Escalator See Alternate # 03 $625,300.00 $625,300.00
2 Otis Elevator See Alternate # 03 $315,500.00 $315,500.00
3 Schindler See Alternate # 03 No Bid No Bid

$0.00 315,500.00$             

$17,274,354.00 19,003,023.00$       

$20,356,148.00TOTAL PROJECT RESULTS:
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